RESOLUTION NO. 16- 235

A RESOLUTION OF THE TOWN COMMISSION OF
THE TOWN OF SURFSIDE, FLORIDA,
AUTHORIZING, AFTER THE FACT, THE
EXPENDITURE OF FUNDS IN THE AMOUNT OF
$156,965.00 FROM THE FISCAL YEAR 2015/2016
PUBLIC WORKS FUND ACCOUNT
NO. 403-4000-534-6410, FOR THE PURCHASE OF A
2015 MACK TRUCK WITH DUMP AND GRAPPLE;

PROVIDING FOR APPROVAL AND
AUTHORIZATION; AND PROVIDING FOR AN
EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, the Public Works Department requested a 2015 Mack truck with
dump and grapple, to more efficiently remove vegetation, construction debris, and bulk
material from the residential area; and

WHEREAS, staff currently picks up curbed waste material by hand and places it
into the back of the rear load trucks; and

WHEREAS, the Town’s current fleet of rear load trucks are not designed to
accept yard or bulky waste materials; therefore, the current use is causing additional
strain on the trucks and decreasing its life expectancy; and

WHEREAS, a new Mack truck will also help ease the possibility of injuries
associated with picking up solid waste material; and

WHEREAS, the cost to purchase a 2015 Mack truck, as well as to outfit and
install the necessary equipment, and graphics is $156,965.00; and

WHEREAS, funding for a 2015 Mack truck, which was approved in the budget,
will be taken out of the Fiscal Year 2015/2016 Public Works Fund Account
No. 403-4000-534-6410; and

WHEREAS, the Public Works Department utilized two (2) Florida Sheriff’s
Association bid lists in order to get the lowest and best prices for this purchase. The first
bid was for the 2016 Mack C or G series (Attachment “A”) and the second bid was for
the 2016 Peterbilt 567 (Attachment “B™); and

WHEREAS, the purchase of a new truck, with dump and grapple attachment,
will allow Town staff to pick up waste from residential areas in a more timely and cost-
effective manner, and
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WHEREAS, it is in the best interest of the Town to authorize, after the fact, the
expenditure of funds in the amount of $156,965.00 from the Fiscal Year 2015/2016
Public Works Fund Account No. 403-4000-534-6410.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE TOWN COMMISSION
OF THE TOWN OF SURFSIDE, FLORIDA, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Recitals. That the above stated recitals are hereby adopted and
confirmed.

Section 2. Approval and Authorization to Expend Funds. The Town
Commission hereby approves and authorizes, after the fact, the Town Manager to
purchase a 2015 Mack truck, with dump and grapple, in the amount of $156,965.00 from
the Fiscal Year 2015/2016 Public Works Fund Account No. 403-4000-534-6410.

Section 3. Implementation. The Town Manager and/or designee are hereby
authorized to take any and all action necessary to implement this Resolution.

Section 4. Effective Date. This Resolution shall become effective immediately
upon its adoption.

N <
PASSED AND ADOPTED this__ |- day of ¢ AU QT g ,2016.
Motion by ; g ) s
Second by Mr;qor Dwetch
FINAL VOTE ON ADOPTION
Commissioner Barry Cohen Meenr
Commissioner Michael Karukin :\Qb
Commissioner Marta Olchyk
Vice Mayor Eli Tourgeman o<l
Mayor Daniel Dietch }‘ﬁs
M

Daniel Dietch, Mayor
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ATTEST:

Sandra Novoa,

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND
CGAL SUFFICIENCY FOR THE TOWN OF SURFSIDE ONLY:

)/‘“0“ (YLM

Linda Miller, Town Attorney
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ATTACHMENT "A"

Vol AR Y K

COUNTIES
—
All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

52,000 LB. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #14

2016 Mack C or G Series

The Mack C or G Series purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $109,300.00 $109,300.00 $109,300.00 $109,300.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Order Code

Order Code
1001646 !

1001657 '

1001659 !

1362131 !
1361311 !
1362158 !
1362160 !
1361445 !

14F44R !

20F44R !

20F46R '

C or G Series
NEXTRAN TRUCK NEXTRAN TRUCK NEXTRAN TRUCK NEXTRAN TRUCK
CENTERS CENTERS CENTERS CENTERS
Westem Northern Central Southern
$109,300.00 $109,300.00 $109,300.00 $109,300.00
Delete Options All Zones
Engine/transmission - specify NA
Engine/transmission - specify NA
Engine/transmission - specify NA
Engine/transmission - specify NA
Add Options All Zones
Engine upgrade - specify $575.00'
MP7-40SHP 1
Engine upg{ade - specify $2,100.00'
MP8-125HP
Engine upgrade - specify $5,738.00"
MP8-505HP. Inctudes Options: Fuller FRO-18210C (1362174) and Spicer Heavy Duty Driveline (1952203),
Engine upgrade - specify NA
Engine upgrade - specify NA
Transmission upgrade - specify $520.00"
Eaton Fuller 14908LL |
Transmission upgrade - specify $1,260.00"
Mack T310M OR Eaton Fuller 16908LL
Transmission upgrade - specify $1,780.00"
Mack T313 OR Eaton Fuller 169134
Transmission upgrade - speci $3,055.00l
Mack T318 OR Eaton Fuller 18918B
Transmission upgrade - specify $3,255.00'
Mack 12 Speed M-Drive |
58,000 Ib. GVWR package $2,100.00"
includes Options: 14k From Axle (2401507), 44k Rear Axle (2681004), Mack Camelback Suspension (1861034), 11R22.5
Tires (9001176), Upgraded Frame Rail (2741028). 1
64,000 1b. GVWR package $4,800.00'
Includes Options: 20k Front Axle (2401501), 44k Rear Axle (2681004), Mack Camelback Suspension (1861034), 425 Front
Tires (9001364), Steel 12.25" Wheels (5312726), Upgraded Steering Box (2452211). Heavy Frame Rail (2741029). Minor
Options: 2411105, 2720197 1
GVWR upgrade - specify $5,130.00'
66,000 Ib. GVWR package. Includes Options: 20k Ib. Fromt Axle (2401501), 46k Rear Axles (2681020), Mack Camelback
Suspension (1861035), 425/65R22.5 Tires (9001364), Steel 12.25" Wheels (5312726), Upgraded Steering Box (2452211),
Heavy Frame Rail (2741029). Minor Options: 2641000, 2629009. 2090005, 2411105, 2720197 )
GVWR upgrade - specify NA
GVWR upgrade - specify NA
GVWR upgrade - specify NA
GVWR upgrade - specify NA
Bi-fuel model - specify NA

Bid Award Announcement 15-13-0904
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:;
BASE PRICE:

2902A50 !

1364540 '
2710208

2401507 '

2401500 '

2401501 !

2681026 '

NEX 13 RDA !
NEX 13 SDA !

NEX 20 RDA !

1862420 '
1861508 !
NEX 128D’
NEX 18SD !

NEX 60
174/RP4500 !

C or G Series

NEXTRAN TRUCK NEXTRAN TRUCK NEXTRAN TRUCK NEXTRAN TRUCK

CENTERS CENTERS CENTERS CENTERS

Western Northern Central Southern

$109,300.00 $109,300.00 £109,300.00 $109,300.00
CNG prep - specify NA
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA
Dual fuel tanks, or equivalent $766.00"
Inchudes 50 Gallon Ahaninum Fuel Tunk on Right Hand Side |
Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire NA
Allison 4000RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent NA
Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent $14,542.00"
Double Frame: full steel insert $I,942.00I
Includes Opt]ians: Heavy Frame Rail (2741029), SMM Steel Channel Insert (2731007), Heavy Duty Crossmenibers
(2811056,
Front Axle: 14,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs NA
Front Axle: 14,600 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs $810.00"
Includes Tire and Wheel Upgrades. 1
Front Axle: 16,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs NA
Front Axle: 18,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs $3,019.00’
includes Options: 425 Front Tires (9001364), 12.25 " Steel Wheels (5312726). 16.5X6 Front Brakes (2411105), Upgraded
Steering Rox (2452211). !
Front Axle: 20,000 Ib. rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs $4,100.00I
includes Options: 425 Front Tives (9001364), 12.25" Steel Wheels (5312726), 16.5x6 Front Brakes (241 1105), Upgraded
Steering Box (2452211), Heavy Duty Frame Rail (2741029). 1
Rear Axle: 46,000 [b Arvin Meritor, Eaton, Mack, or equivalent $2,475.00'
Includes 46k Mack Rear Axle with Camelback OR M-Ride Suspensicn. |
Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels $5,000.00"
Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel $tS,550.00l
wheels
Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 [b rating air Jift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels $5,650.()0l
Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to include 1 1R-22.5 tires with steel NA
wheels
Rear Suspension: 40,000 Ib air ride NA
Rear Suspension: 46,000 1b Chalmers, Hendrickson, Mack, Volvo "T" ride or equivalent $2,246.00|
46k Haulmax Suspension (1862420). Includes Options: 46k Rear Axle (2681026), 16.5x7" Brakes (2531 104). |
Rear Suspension: 46,000 Ib air ride $1 ,000.00l
Includes Options: 46k Rear Axle (2681904). 1
12 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid. $14,225.00'
12 Cubic Yard, 14' Steel Dump Body 1
18 yd. dump bady with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid. $16,275.00'
18 Cubic Yard. 16’ Steel Dump Body
Rolloff hoist system and mq system. State model bid. $35,0()0.()0|
60,000 Lb. Rolloff Holst and Tarp
Cab suspension - air ride Std
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

8269013 !

Transfer 1

New

3YR/300K !
4YR/300K '

5YR/400K !

C or G Scries

NEXTRAN TRUCK
CENTERS

Western
$109,300.00

Optional eqluipment - specify
Parker Pump

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)

NEXTRAN TRUCK
CENTERS

Northern
$109,300.00

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify
Warranty - specify

3 Year, 300,000 Mile Warranty on Mack Engine Plan 2 and Exhaust After Treaiment System with Engines Under 460HP.

Warranty - specify

NEXTRAN TRUCK
CENTERS

Central
$109,300.00

NEXTRAN TRUCK

CENTERS
Southern
$109,300.00

4 Year, 300,000 Mile Warranty on Mack Engine Plan 2 and Exhaust Afier Treatment System with Engines Under 460HP. |

Warranty - specify

S Year, 400,000 Mrle Warranty on Mack Engine Plan 2 and Exhaust Afier Treatment System with Engines Under 460HP.

Diesel Warranty - specify

Diesel Warranty - specify
Diesel Warranty - specify

Bid Award Announcement 15-13-0904

$890.00'

NA
NA

Incl.
$100.00'
$300.00'
NA

NA

NA
$1,600.00

$2,275.00!
$4,000.00"

NA
NA
NA
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ATTACHMENT "B"

/S

FAC

FLORIDA

<40 CIATION O

COUNTIES
T PP
All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

52,000 LB. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #14

2016 Peterbilt 567

The Peterbilt 567 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southem
BASE PRICE: -- No bid - $108,362.50 $108,362.50 $110,544.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Order Code
365 2

348 2

Order Code

2057560 2
2057615 3

2057732 2
20577453

2057746 2
2059939 3

2059953 2
2072810 3

2056315 2
20577323

4052110/ 40552230 2
4040810 °

4052420 2

4040810 2
See Dealer 2

4040830 2

Rush Truck Center of Tampa Rush Truck Center of Tampa Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers

567
Western Northern Central
--No bid -- $108,362.50 $108,362.50
Delete Options
Engme/transmlssxon specify
Peterbilt Model 365 2

Engine/transmission - specify
Peterbilt Modzl 348 2

Engine/transmission - specify
Engine/transmission - specify

Add Options

Engine upgrade - specify
CUMMINS i5X12-G 350 HP 1450 LB2 TORQUE other available engine
options list-10% see dealer 2

1SX12 385 HP 3

Engine upgrade - s
CUMMINS 1SX12-G 400 HP 1450 LB TORQUE other available engine
options list -10% see dealer 2

ISX12 425 HP 3

Engine upgrade - specify
CUMMINS ISX-12 425 HP 1650 TORQUE other available engine options
list -10% see dealer 2

ISX15 500HP 3

Engine upgrade - specify
ISX15 5;0@2000 2050@1200 other available engine options list -10% see
dealer

MX13455HP3

Engine upgrade - specify
ISL-G 320/2200 1600@1300 Model 348 other available engine options list
-10% see dealer 2

ISX12-G 400 HP 3

Transmission upgrade - specify
Allison 3500 / 3000 RDSP include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved
equivalent

RTO 16908LL 3

Transmission upgrade - specify
Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or
approved equivalent 2

Transmission upgrade - specify
FULLER RTOI6908LL 10 SPEED 2

Transmission upgrade - specify
Other Transmission options available -106% off list see dealer 2

Transmission upgrade - syeclfy
Fuller RTI.OL6913A 13-speed

Bid Award Announcement 15-13-0904

Southemn
$110,544.00

Northern
Western & Central

(52,412.00)>
(319,061.50)>

NA
NA

Northern
Western & Central

$18,174.00°

$3,829.00°

$5,233.002

$20,265.00%

$10,034.00°

$20,696.00%

$1,208.00%
$0.002

$907.002

Southern

NA

NA

NA
NA

Southern
$16,659.00° $1,401.00°

$2,400.00°

$7,200.00°

$3,600.00°

$20,193.00°

$1,174.00°

580
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

0514020 2

4543430 / 45434402

RUSH 2

Rush 2

90115-22

5554100 2

4052410
40524103

4052420 2
40524203

0601500 2

1012400 2
1011350 3

Rush Truck Center of Tampa Rush Truck Center of Tampa Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers

567
Western Northern Central
-- No bid -- $108,362.50 $108,362.50

58,000 Ib. GVWR 2package
See dealer for pricing

AVABLE SEE DEALER 3

64,000 Ib. GVWR package
1 0-3/41» Steel Rails 2

20,000 LB FRONT / 46.000LB REAR 3

GVWR upgrade - specify
Clear Outside Frame Rail Pkg. 2

GVWR upgrade - specify
407 Pintle pkg (including 1"plate,pintle and D-ringa) *Air liiU! f and electric
supplied by dealer 2

GVWR upgrade - specify
Wetline kitfor iranafer or walkingfloor PTOfor manual transmisaion 2

GVWR upgrade - specify
GVWR upgrade - specify

Bi-fuel model - specify
See Dealer

CNG prep - specify
Momentum Fuel Technologies 90 DGE Rail Moumed Tanks 80 DGE System

Deduct -1191.03 60 DGE System Deduct -2641.03 2
STANDARD WITH CNG 3

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer)
Optional CNG Fuel delivery systems available see dealer 2

SEE DEALER 3

LPG conversion (discuss with dealer)
See Dealer 2

AVABLE SEE DEALER 3

Dual fuel tanks, or equlvalent
26" Aluminum 70 gal. 2

80 GAL FUEL TANK 3
Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire

Allison 4000RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil,
TES 295 or approved equivalent

Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil,
TES 295 or approved equivalent

Double Frame: full steel insert

Front Axle: 14,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity
steering gear and springs
Front Axle: 14,600 b rating to include equal capacity
steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 16,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity
steering gear and springs

Bid Award Announcement 15-13-0904

Southern
$110,544.00

$0.002
$657.00%

$531.002

$1,450.00°

$8,500.00°

NA
NA
$0.00%

$41,540.20%

$0.002
$0.002
$309.002
NA
$20,696.00%

$21,300.002

$1,107.00?
NA

$399.002

NA

$0.00°

$8,895.00°

NA

NA

NA

NA
NA
Std

std®

$0.00°

$0.00°

$360.00°

NA
$21,523.00°
$22,996.00°

Incl.
NA

$1,440.00°

NA
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VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

1012400 2
1011360 3

1526130 2
1523340 3

1604180 2
1604180 3

1604180 2
1603145 3

1604150 2
1604150 3

1603470 2
1603470 3

18218102
1824240 %

1821640 2

FA00055281 2
FA0055280 3

FA00055283 2
FA00055283 >

Ring Power 5420 2
GALBREATH 3

7852020 2

1687090 2
GALFAB >

Ring Power Quote #5423 2

AMPAROLL 3

Rush Truck Center of Tampa Rush Truck Center of Tampa Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers

567
Western Northern Central
-- No bid - $108.362.50 $108,362.50

Front Axle: 18,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity
steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 20,000 Ib. rating to include equal capacity
steering gear and springs

Rear Axle: 46,000 Ib Arvin Meritor, Eaton, Mack, or
equivalent

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to
include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to
include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to
include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to
include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Rear Suspension: 40,000 Ib air ride
Peterbilt Air Trac 2

Rear Suspension: 46,000 Ib Chalmers, Hendrickson, Mack,
Volvo "T" ride or equivalent
Rear Suspension: 46,000 Ib air ride

12 yd. dump bedy with hoist and electric tarp system. State
model bid.

14" 12/14 yd dump for 114" CT w/ 1/4" plate floor (including Hotshift PTO
Jor Automatic trans ,air tailgate, eleciric tarp system) 2

SEE DEALER FOR DETAILS 3

18 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State

model bid.
16' 17/19yd dump for 138" CT w/ 1/4" plate floor (including hotshifi PTO
for auto trans air Vgate , Elec tarptr system) 2

SEE DEALER FOR DETAILS 3

Rolloff hoist system and tarp system. State model bid.
AMERICAN ROLL-OFF MODEL ART-60-22 / Above Frame ART 60
Roll-Off Mounted on Cusiomer ‘s Chassis Including PTO / Pump /Hoses.
Instillation Includes Poly Fenders, LED Lighting. ICC Bumper. Roll-Off.
Mounting Finished in Black. Standard Raichet Style Container Hold-Down.
Ploneer Tarp System Installed. 2

GALBREATH QUT/SIDE RAIL HOIST US-OR-174 WITH TARP SEE
DEALER FOR DETAILS3

Cab suspension - air ride

Driver controlled differential lock
GALFAB OUTSIDE RAIL HOIST WITH TARP OR601745072 SEE
DEALER FOR DETAILS 3

Optional mounted body - specify
Palfinger T-50 Hooklift System / Pioneer SARG Tarp / Recommended
Chassis 66,000 GVW 2

ALI60190022 50,000 LN HOOK ROLL/OFF SEE DEALER FOR
DETAILS 3

Bid Award Announcement 15-13-0904

Southem
$110,544.00

NA
$1,814.00°
$2,895.00%

$12,425.00%

$15,789.00°
$14,200.00%
$14,380.00%
$913.002
$2,846.00°

$1,479.00%
$15,200.00%

$15,975.00%

$47,500.00°

$226.00°
$1,498.00%

$54,500.00%

NA
$2,612.00°
$5,521.00°

$12,982.00°

$10,347.00°
$14,882.00°
$16,200.00°
Std
$5,521.00

$3,676.00
$14,249.00°

$15,342.00°

$39,360.00°

Std
$38,465.00°

$42,548.00°
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VEHICLE: 567

Southern
$110,544.00

$160,500.00%

$0.00

DEALER: Rush Truck Center of Tampa Rush Truck Center of Tampa  Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers
ZONE: Western Northern Central
BASE PRICE: ~No bid - $108,362.50 $108,362.50
Ring Power Quote #5421 2 Optional mounted body - specify
Palfinger Epsilon Q150 284 11 Grapple Loader / American Rolloff ART

Ring Power Quote#H5426 2
Ring Power Quote #5422 2
Ring Power Quote #5419 2

WEP-QX-GAL-AF-OR-174 2

WEP-QX-EZ-REL-G400-25 2

Heil 2016FSA 2
Heil 2016FSA 2

0BC201208212127 2

SSES 2

WBSE 2

M2

im?
m?

Jm?

60-22 / Recommended Chassis 66,00) GVW *** Include CNG Application
**%Spec available see Dealer 2

ALLTEC ARIAREL LIFT AVABLE SEE DEALER FIOR PRICE 3

Optional mounted body - specify
Epsilon Azll.? A Frame Grapple Loader / Ox 24 / 50 Yard Trash Body
w/Hoist

Optional mounted bedy - specify
Epsilon S260L130 Canal Maintenance Crane Package Boom length 42' 8"
single telescape W/. 40 Yard Ox Dump Body. Spec available see Dealer 2

Optional mounted body - specify
Epsilon M100L72 Hydraulic Loader / 28 Yard Dump Body See Dealer for
additional specs. see dealer for additional options and specs

Optional mounted body - specify

GALBREATH AF-OR-174 ABOVE FRAME MOUNT 60.000 LBS
GALBREATH US-OR-174 60,000 LBS Deduct -1,019.89 see dealer for
additional options and specs

Optional mounted body - specify
E-Z PACK GOLIATH G400 25YD REAR LOADER E-Z PACK GOLIATH
G300C 25YD REL Deduct -6,449.00 see dealer for additional options and

specs 2

Optional mounted body - specify
Heil DP5000 25yd see dealer for additional options 2

Optional mounted body - specify
Heil Kwikiifi Roll-Off Holst see dealer for additional options and specs 2

Optional mounted body - specify

McNeilus Model 3216: 3.5HD 32 yd Rear Loader McNeilus Model 2516:
3.5HD 25 yd Deduct - 1,152 BEHIND THE CAB CNG MOUNT 75DGE ADD
$35,000.00 see dealer for additional options and specs 2

Optional equipment - specify

New Way King Cobra 25RL Rear Loader New Way Cobra Magnum 25RL
Rear Loader Deduct -3,167.00 see dealer for additional options and
specs.

Optional equipment - specify
LEACH 2-R-111 32 yd LEACH 2-R-1lI 29 yd Deduct -969.88 LEACH 2-R-1l]
25 yd Deduct -2,846.96 see dealer for additional options and specs. 2

Optional equipment - specify

PAC-MAC KB220 SERIES KNUCLE-BOOM LOADER-25 FT/ 44 Cubic
Yard - 22 FT/ 30 Cubic Yard* Deduct 4,825 See Dealer for additional
options and Specs. 2

Optional equipment - specify
PAC-MAC LV SERIES LEAF VACUUM TRUCK BODY PAC-MAC RLX
SERIES REAR LOAD 25yd Deduct - 2

Optional equipment - specify
AMPLRIOLL HOOKLIFT ROLL-OFF HOIST (50,600 lbs) AL160-1900-22
all models available see dealer for additional options and specs. 2

Optional equipment - specify
PAC-MAC RLX SERIES REAR LOAD 25yd 2

Bid Award Announcement 15-13-0904

$104,500.00>
$194,000.00°
$90,500.00°

$43,468.25°

$72,849.00%

$66,868.00%
$51,560.00%

$67.274.00°

$65,159.00°

$60,318.00°

$72,525.00°

$58,750.00°
$39,339.00°

$56,895.00%

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

PI Quote No: 60009 2

Container Systems 2

Container Systems 2

McNeilus 2

9402783 2

9402659 2

9401704 2

9402705 2

Rush Truck Center of Tampa Rush Truck Center of Tampa  Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers

567
Western Northern Central
-- No bid — $108,362.50 $108,362.50

Optional equipment - specify

Petersen Industries MODEL AL3 BASE LOADER W/MODEL 2240) HDX

HARDOX BODY See dealer for Additional options and Specs. 2

Optional equipment - specify

Loadmaster Excel §-25 yd. REL 27 yd Add 900.00 33 yd. Add 2,000.00

Additional options available see dealer.

Optional equipment - specify

Palfinger American Hawki Crane / 28yd dump body add +2,900.00 for 40yd

body option. See dealer for additional specs and options. 2

Optional equipment - specify

McNeilus Concrete Mixers available see dealer for options, specs and

Jactory direct pricing. 2

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify

Tempo:
SEE DEALER FOR DETAILS 3

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)

SEE DEALER FOR DETAILS 3

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)
SEE DEALER FOR DETAILS 3

Maintenance Plan - specify
Mobile options available see dealer for pricing 2

SEE DEALER FOR DETAILS 3

Maintenance Plan - specify
Scheduled programs available see dealer for pricing 2

SEE DEALER FOR DETAILS 3

Maintenance Plan - specify
Full maintenance plans available see dealer for pricing options, 2

SEE DEALER FOR DETAILS 3

Warranty - specify
Cummiins ISX-12G Protection Plan 1 Syr./150K 2
SEE DEALER FOR DETAILS 3

Warranty - specify
Cumnins ISX-12G Protection Plan | Syr./150K 2
SEE DEALER FOR DETAILS 3

Warranty - specify
Basic Vehicle 2/200% 2
SEE DEALER FOR DETAILS 3

Diesel Warranty - specify
Cummins 1SX Protection Plan | 5yr./200K 2
SEE DEALER FOR DETAILS 3

Bid Award Announcement 15-13-0904

Southern
$110,544.00

$89,494,00°
$58,371.00%
$85,672.00°

$0.002

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
Incl.

$150.00
$170.00

$0.00°

$0.002

$0.002

$3,400.007

$2,100.00%

$1,265.00%

$1,400.00%

584

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA

$0.00°

$0.00°
$0.00°

$0.00°

$0.00°

$0.00°

$0.00°

$0.00°

$0.00°

$0.00°



VEHICLE: 567

DEALER: Rush Truck Center of Tampa Rush Truck Center of Tampa Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid - $108,362.50 $108,362.50 $110,544.00
9402534 2 Diesel Warranty - specify $2,700.00° $0.00°

Paacar PX-9 Protection Plan ] 5yr./150 2

SEE DEALER FOR DETAILS 3

Diesel Warranty - speci NA $0.00°
-SEE DEALER FOR DETAILS
585
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